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M O U N T A I N  H I G H S N O W S P O R T  C L U BLet’s ski together!

Let’s try the Mt. Hood Express 
bus from Sandy

We’ve been encouraging people to meet up in Sandy 
and carpool from there.  This year, let’s try to use the 
new Mountain Express bus service from Sandy to Ski-
bowl, Government Camp and/or Timberline for just 
One way fare is just $2 (or $1.50 if  you prepay for 20 
tickets).   That’s less than you’d spend on gas!

Catch the bus at the Forest Service Park & Ride, right 
on Hwy. 26, at a bus stop half  way between Champion 
Way and 362nd (which is the Fred Meyer traffic light 
in Sandy). Turn into Champion Way to park at the Mt. 
Hood National Forest Information Center. 

The most convenient time for us is:

1. Leave Forestry Service Park & Ride at 7:45 am, 
    arrive at Skibowl West at 8:32 am, 
    arrive at Timberline at 9:00 am.

2. Depart from Timberline at 2:45 pm or 4:45 pm. 
    arrive in Sandy at 3:58 or 5:58 pm.

See the schedule on the Clackamas County Moun-
tain Express website, http://www.mthoodexpress.
com/#!schedule-map/c1h6a

If  you miss us there, try to connect with us on the 
Mountain using 2-way radios on channel 6-19.  But, 
this might not be easy.  We often carry 2-way radios on 
ski trips to new places, but few of  us seem to use them 
on our local mountain. 

So, it’s best to connect in Sandy and start the day together.  

Only, which days will this happen?  Well, there is no 
fixed schedule.  If  we find out there is a group of  us 
going, we’ll try to let everyone know via an email blast.

Also, remember to communicate directly with other 
club members using our online Forum and our Face-
book page. There are menu buttons to both on our home 
page at www.mthigh.org.  Feel free to announce your 
intentions to go skiing on a particular day.
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